
 TOWN OF CARMEL 
TOWN HALL 

60 McAlpin Avenue 
Mahopac, New York 10541 

Tel. (845) 628-1500  •  Fax (845) 628-6836 
www.ci.carmel.ny.us 

TOWN BOARD WORK SESSION 
Wednesday, May 8th, 2024 7:00pm 

 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE - MOMENT OF SILENCE 
Town Board Work Session Meeting: 
• Review Town Board Minutes April 17th & May 1st, 2024

1. Nina Kallmeyer, Director of Parks & Recreation – Consider Request to Accept Donation of Park Bench for
Airport Part, offered by Mahopac Sports Association in remembrance of Chris Provenzano

2. Nina Kallmeyer, Director of Parks & Recreation – Consider Request to Appoint Donna Proft to Recreation
Advisory Committee

3. Nina Kallmeyer, Director of Parks & Recreation – Consider Request to Appoint Zachary Frank as Senior
Recreation Leader, CSEA Group 8 Step 1

4. Michael Stern, Highway Superintendent – Consider Request to Purchase 2016 Ford Transit Van
5. Richard J. Franzetti P.E., Town Engineer – Consider Request to Return Bond for Day Road LLC –

TM-55.6-1-41 Bond Register #814
6. Richard J. Franzetti P.E., Town Engineer – Consider Acknowledgment of Emergency Repairs for Carmel

Sewer District #7, Value Installation
7. Richard J. Franzetti P.E., Town Engineer – Consider Request for Installation of Trailer Unit for PFOA Pilot

Study, Carmel Water District #8
8. Richard J. Franzetti P.E., Town Engineer – Consider Request to Extend Cemetery Maintenance Service to

Kiko’s Landscaping
9. Richard J. Franzetti P.E., Town Engineer – Consider Request to Extend Lake Secor Maintenance Services

to Bella Vista
10. Richard J. Franzetti P.E., Town Engineer – Consider Request to Extend Teakettle Lake Maintenance

Services to Kiko’s Landscaping

MICHAEL S. CAZZARI 
Town Supervisor 

FRANK D. LOMBARDI 
Town Councilman  
Deputy Supervisor 

ROBERT KEARNS 
Town Councilman 

SUZANNE MC DONOUGH 
Town Councilwoman 
 

ALICE DALY 
Town Clerk 

KATHLEEN KRAUS 
Receiver of Taxes 

MICHAEL STERN 
Superintendent of Highways 

Tel. (845) 628-7474 

•Personnel

• Public Comments on Town Related Business (Five (5) Minutes Maximum for Town Residents,
Property Owners & Business Owners Only)

• Motion to Adjourn Work Session

• Motion to Move to Executive Session

Town Board Executive Session:



Work Session Item #1









Work Session Item #2



Work Session Item #3



Work Session Item #4











Work Session Item #5









Richard J.Franzetti, P.E. (845) 628-1500 
Town Engineer (845) 628-2087  

Fax (845) 628-7085 

Office of the Town Engineer 
60 McAlpin Avenue 

Mahopac, New York 10541 

Tel: (845) 628-1500  Fax: (845) 628-7085  email  rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us 
G:\Engineering\Town Board\Emergency Invoices\05-08-24\04-26-24  Emergency Repair Acknowlegement  to TB.doc 

MEMORANDUM 

To: Carmel Town Board  

From: Richard J. Franzetti P.E. Town Engineer 

Date: April 26, 2024 

Re: Emergency Repairs/Services 

This memorandum is being presented to the Town Board to advise the Board of the attached 
emergency invoice that was submitted for payment/authorization to proceed in excess of 
$10,000.00 for services rendered.   The following provides a brief a summary of the work that 
was performed.   

• CSD7  - Valve Installation

On April 4, 2024 Inframark the operators for CSD 7, notified the Engineering Department 
that a bypass valve at the mixing box is seized in the closed position ( it should be closed 
under normal conditions). Inframark used the valve exercising machine on full torque and 
were still unable to open the valve. This valve is needed to in order bypass flow past the 
mixing box instead of through. Attached please find an invoice from Kuck Excavating in the 
amount of $12,686.035 to make this repair 

Per the attached, there are sufficient funds in the operating budget for this expense. 

We request that this memorandum be put into the agenda as a matter of record. 

Work Session Item #6







From: Esteves,Donna
To: Franzetti,Richard
Subject: 04-15-24 ~ TOC 025-24
Date: Monday, April 15, 2024 2:58:29 PM
Attachments: SKM_C450i24041512210.pdf

Rich,

See attached invoice for the emergency valve repair at the CSD7 sewer plant that will require Board
authorization. There are sufficient funds in the budget, however, I will submitting a budget transfer
request to the contractual line which is currently over budget.

Thanks,

Donna Esteves
Town of Carmel ~ Engineering Department
60 Mc Alpin Ave
Mahopac, NY 10541
845-628-1500 ext. 184

 



Richard J.Franzetti, P.E. (845) 628-1500 
Town Engineer (845) 628-2087  

Fax (845) 628-7085 

Office of the Town Engineer 
60 McAlpin Avenue 

Mahopac, New York 10541 

Tel: (845) 628-1500  Fax: (845) 628-7085  email  rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us 
G:\Engineering\Water\01 - PFOA\01 - Proposal\Pilot Study\Pilot Costs\Bee and Jay\04-29-24 PFOA Pilot trailer install  to TB.doc 

MEMORANDUM 

To: Carmel Town Board  

From: Richard J. Franzetti P.E. Town Engineer  

Date: April 29, 2024  

Re: Trailer Unit Installation for PFOA Pilot Study 

Bee and Jay, the operators for Carmel Water District #8 (CWD 8), has advised the 
Engineering Department (Department) of costs associated with the pilot trailer installed 
as part of the PFOA pilot study. 

The attached invoice from Bee and Jay  for the installation of the trailer unit at the filter 
plant for the pilot study, in the amount of $17,384.85 cost will be split evenly between all 
districts (~$1,240 per).   

Per the attached, until a capital plan is established, all expenses will be tracked and 
charged through a separate line in the operating budget (.0022-treatment of PFOS). 
Future budget transfer requests to cover these costs; some of which will have to be 
provided for through the Unreserved/Reserved fund balance, based on the needs of the 
of individual districts will be required.  

This Department respectfully requests that this be placed on the next Town Board work 
session.  

Work Session Item #7























From: Esteves,Donna
To: Franzetti,Richard
Cc: Maxwell,Mary Ann; Tenefrancia,Michelle
Subject: 04-16-23 ~ Trailer Unit Installation for PFOS Study
Date: Tuesday, April 16, 2024 12:18:43 PM
Attachments: HPSCAN_20240415180631713_2024-04-15_180719412.pdf

Rich,

Please see attached invoice from Bee and Jay for the installation of the trailer unit at the filter plant
for the pilot study, which will require a Town Board resolution. The $17,384 cost will be split
evenly between all districts (~$1,240 per).

Until a capital plan is established, all expenses will be tracked and charged through a separate line in
the operating budget (.0022-treatment of PFOS). I will be submitting future budget transfer requests
to cover these costs; some of which will have to be provided for through the Unreserved/Reserved
fund balance, based on the needs of the of individual districts.

Thanks,

Donna Esteves
Town of Carmel ~ Engineering Department
60 Mc Alpin Ave
Mahopac, NY 10541
845-628-1500 ext. 184

 



Richard J.Franzetti, P.E. (845) 628-1500 
Town Engineer (845) 628-2087  

Fax (845) 628-7085 

Office of the Town Engineer 
60 McAlpin Avenue 

Mahopac, New York 10541 

Tel: (845) 628-1500 Fax: (845) 628-7085 Email:  rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us 

g:\engineering\contracts and rfps\r2021-004 cemetary maintenance\to tb - renewal\04-26-14  r2021-004- recommend to extend to tb.doc 

MEMORANDUM 

To: Carmel Town Board  

From: Richard J. Franzetti P.E. Town Engineer 

Date: April 26, 2024  

Re: R2021-004- Cemetery Maintenance  

As the Board may recall, in 2021, the Engineering Department solicited proposals for 
maintenance for the Maintenance of Cemeteries - R2021-004.  The proposal identified 
that the contract would be effective for three (3) years (2022-2024), with the Town of 
Carmel having the unilateral option to renew the contract for up to two (2) more years or 
any portion thereof (2025-2026).  Kiko’s Landscape was the lowest responsible 
proposer.   

Kiko’s Landscaping has sufficiently performed the Cemetery Maintenance since 2014 s. 
Therefore, we recommend that the Town of Carmel exercise its option and extend for 
2025 and 2026.   

The costs would be $15,675.00 for 2025 and $15,675.00 for 2026. 

As identified in the attached the costs will be included in the 2025/2026 budgets. 

I request that this matter be placed on an upcoming work session for discussion.  

Work Session Item #8



From: Esteves,Donna
To: Franzetti,Richard; Maxwell,Mary Ann
Subject: RE: R2021-004 - cemetery Maintenance funding
Date: Friday, April 26, 2024 2:48:44 PM

It will be included in the operating budget.

Donna Esteves
Town of Carmel ~ Engineering Department
60 Mc Alpin Ave
Mahopac, NY 10541
845-628-1500 ext. 184

From: Franzetti,Richard <rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us> 
Sent: Friday, April 26, 2024 2:18 PM
To: Esteves,Donna <de@ci.carmel.ny.us>; Maxwell,Mary Ann <mam@ci.carmel.ny.us>
Subject: R2021-004 - cemetery Maintenance funding
 
Donna and Maryann
 
Are their sufficient funds for 2025/2026 for the attached?
 
Thanks
 
 
Richard J. Franzetti. P.E, BCEE
Town Engineer
60 McAlpin Avenue
Mahopac, New York 10541
Phone - (845) 628-1500 ext 181
Fax – (845) 628-7085
Cell – (914) 843-4704
rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us
 
This communication may be confidential and is intended for the sole use of the addressee(s).  No use or reproduction of the
information provided is permitted without the written consent of the Town of Carmel.  If you are not the intended recipient,
you should not copy, disclose or take any action in reliance on this communication.  If you have received this communication in
error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and delete the message and any attached documents.

 
 
 



Richard J.Franzetti, P.E. (845) 628-1500 
Town Engineer (845) 628-2087  

Fax (845) 628-7085 

Office of the Town Engineer 
60 McAlpin Avenue 

Mahopac, New York 10541 

Tel: (845) 628-1500 Fax: (845) 628-7085 Email:  rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us 

g:\engineering\contracts and rfps\r2021-002 lake secor park maintenance\to tb extension\04-26-24  r2021-002- secor recommend to extend to 
tb.doc 

MEMORANDUM 

To: Carmel Town Board  

From: Richard J. Franzetti P.E. Town Engineer  

Date: April 26, 2024 

Re: R2021-002- Lake Secor Park Maintenance 

As the Board may recall, in 2021, the Engineering Department solicited proposals for 
maintenance for the Lake Secor Park District- R2021-002.  The proposal identified that 
the contract would be effective for three (3) years (2022-2024), with the Town of Carmel 
having the unilateral option to renew the contract for up to two (2) more years or any 
portion thereof (2025-2026).  Bella Vista Landscaping was the lowest responsible 
proposer.   

Bella Visa Landscaping has performed to the satisfaction of both the Lake Secor 
Advisory Board and Engineering Department.  Therefore, we recommend that the Town 
of Carmel exercise its option and extend for 2025 and 2026.   

The costs would be $4,450.00 for 2025 and $4,550.00 for 2026. 

As identified in the attached there are sufficient funds in the budget for this contract and 
thee costs will be included in the 2025/2026 budgets.  

I request that this matter be placed on an upcoming work session for discussion.  

Work Session Item #9



From: Esteves,Donna
To: Franzetti,Richard
Cc: Maxwell,Mary Ann
Subject: RE: R2021-002- Lake Secor Park Maintenance Funidng for 2025 adn 2026
Date: Friday, April 26, 2024 12:00:58 PM

This will be included in the yearly O&M budgets.

Donna Esteves
Town of Carmel ~ Engineering Department
60 Mc Alpin Ave
Mahopac, NY 10541
845-628-1500 ext. 184

From: Franzetti,Richard <rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us> 
Sent: Friday, April 26, 2024 11:58 AM
To: Esteves,Donna <de@ci.carmel.ny.us>
Cc: Maxwell,Mary Ann <mam@ci.carmel.ny.us>
Subject: R2021-002- Lake Secor Park Maintenance Funidng for 2025 adn 2026
 
Donna and Maryann
 
Are their sufficient funds for 2025/2026 for the attached?
 
Thanks
 
Richard J. Franzetti. P.E, BCEE
Town Engineer
60 McAlpin Avenue
Mahopac, New York 10541
Phone - (845) 628-1500 ext 181
Fax – (845) 628-7085
Cell – (914) 843-4704
rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us
 
This communication may be confidential and is intended for the sole use of the addressee(s).  No use or reproduction of the
information provided is permitted without the written consent of the Town of Carmel.  If you are not the intended recipient,
you should not copy, disclose or take any action in reliance on this communication.  If you have received this communication in
error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and delete the message and any attached documents.

 
 
 



Richard J.Franzetti, P.E. (845) 628-1500 
Town Engineer (845) 628-2087  

Fax (845) 628-7085 

Office of the Town Engineer 
60 McAlpin Avenue 

Mahopac, New York 10541 

Tel: (845) 628-1500 Fax: (845) 628-7085 Email:  rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us 

g:\engineering\contracts and rfps\r2021-003 teakettle park maintenance\to tb - renewal\04-26-24  r2021-003- teakettle recommend to extend 
to tb.doc 

MEMORANDUM 

To: Carmel Town Board  

From: Richard J. Franzetti P.E. Town Engineer  

Date: April 26, 2024 

Re: R2021-003- Teakettle Lake Maintenance 

As the Board may recall, in 2021, the Engineering Department solicited proposals for 
maintenance for the Teakettle Lake Park District- R2021-003.  The proposal identified 
that the contract would be effective for three (3) years (2022-2024), with the Town of 
Carmel having the unilateral option to renew the contract for up to two (2) more years or 
any portion thereof (2025-2026).  Kiko’s Landscape was the lowest responsible 
proposer.   

Kiko’s Landscape has performed to the satisfaction of both the Teakettle Lake Advisory 
Board and Engineering Department.  Therefore, we recommend that the Town of 
Carmel exercise its option and extend for 2025 and 2026.   

The costs would be $7,500.00 for 2025 and $7,500.00 for 2026. 

As identified in the attached the costs will be included in the 2025/2026 budgets. 

I request that this matter be placed on an upcoming work session for discussion.  

Work Session Item #10



From: Esteves,Donna
To: Franzetti,Richard; Maxwell,Mary Ann
Subject: RE: R2021-003 - Teakettle Maintenance funding
Date: Friday, April 26, 2024 12:35:14 PM

It will be included in the operating budget.

Donna Esteves
Town of Carmel ~ Engineering Department
60 Mc Alpin Ave
Mahopac, NY 10541
845-628-1500 ext. 184

From: Franzetti,Richard <rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us> 
Sent: Friday, April 26, 2024 12:24 PM
To: Esteves,Donna <de@ci.carmel.ny.us>; Maxwell,Mary Ann <mam@ci.carmel.ny.us>
Subject: R2021-003 - Teakettle Maintenance funding
 
Donna and Maryann
 
Are their sufficient funds for 2025/2026 for the attached?
 
Thanks
 
 
Richard J. Franzetti. P.E, BCEE
Town Engineer
60 McAlpin Avenue
Mahopac, New York 10541
Phone - (845) 628-1500 ext 181
Fax – (845) 628-7085
Cell – (914) 843-4704
rjf@ci.carmel.ny.us
 
This communication may be confidential and is intended for the sole use of the addressee(s).  No use or reproduction of the
information provided is permitted without the written consent of the Town of Carmel.  If you are not the intended recipient,
you should not copy, disclose or take any action in reliance on this communication.  If you have received this communication in
error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and delete the message and any attached documents.
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